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It's tempting simplyto sit
back and marvel in open-
mouthed amazement at the
trulyremarkabletechnical
prowess ofyoungBoston-
bom pianistGeorgeLi, who

made his lnternational Festi-
val debut following compe-
tition wins and high-proflle
bookings the other side oftle
Atlantic. And there's plenty
to be amazed hry, not least his
glittering, galvanisin& f nger-
breaking virtuosity, most
clearlyon showinthe fery
Carmen hanscription tiat
formed his second, begged-
forencore.

He clearly has anintense

personal identif cation witi
the music he's pLafng, even
seeming to conduct certain
passages with his left hand"
or react in surprise at unex-
pected harmonic twists.

But maybe that's the prob-
lem, because there were
some peculiarly idioslmcratic
aspects to his recital - chords
hammered so forcefullythat
pitch was obscured; curious-
ly stop-start rh/thrns; and

britde chimings inhis hlgh
right-hand melodies. Rather
than acting as a conduit for
the composers thowhts,
it was as iftheywere the
\€ssels for Li's huge musical
personality.

And following a rather
overwrought Haydn sonata,
the repertoLe heu chosen
movedsteadilydoser to his
fiery, e!ftrovert style, from a
Chopin Second SoDatathat

was altemately supple and
brutal, with a gratifuingly
no-nonsense ft rneral March
movement, through Rach-
maninot's Corelli Variations
rather exaggerated in tleir ri
contrasts, to two efferves-
cent Liszt showpieces - an
enthralling and thoroughly
entertaining conctusionto ")
whathad been apuzzling
recital.
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